| | Bodree Printing | | DLUX Printing & Publishing, Inc | | FormSystems | | Franklins | | National Imprint Corporation* | | Office Depot** | | TMT Printing | | Office- pointe | Livingston Business Forms | Top Flight |
|--------------------------------------|--------------------|--------------------------|------------------------------------|---------------------------|----------------|------------------|--------------------|--------------------------|----------------------------------|--------------------------|----------------------|---------------------------|--------------------|--------------------------|-------------------|---------------------------------|------------------|
| Item # | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Total | Unit Price | Unit Price | Unit Price |
| 1.A 1.B | - | | \$130.45 \$91.24 | \$13,045.00 \$9,124.00 | \$67.15 NA | \$6,715.00 NA | \$53.40 \$53.40 | \$5,340.00 \$5,340.00 | \$41.07 \$43.52 | \$2,053.50 \$2,176.00 | \$92.16 \$98.81 | \$9,216.00 \$9,881.00 | \$24.92 \$28.67 | \$2,492.00 \$2,867.00 | NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID | NO BID |
| 2.A 2.B | | \$3,050.00 \$3,200.00 | \$138.43 \$81.75 | \$13,843.00 \$8,175.00 | \$61.43 NA | \$6,143.00 NA | \$71.75 \$71.75 | \$7,175.00 \$7,175.00 | \$40.83 \$55.92 | \$2,041.50 \$2,796.00 | \$84.79 \$101.17 | \$8,479.00 \$10,117.00 | \$31.10 \$35.77 | \$3,110.00 \$3,577.00 | NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID |
| 3.A 3.B | \$48.00 \$51.00 | \$480.00 \$510.00 | \$107.40 \$107.40 | \$1,074.00 \$1,074.00 | \$117.50 NA | \$1,175.00 NA | \$65.74 \$65.74 | \$657.40 \$657.40 | \$72.96 NA | \$364.80 NA | \$110.24 \$125.07 | \$1,102.40 \$1,250.70 | \$62.45 \$62.45 | \$624.50 \$624.50 | NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID | NO BID |
| 4.A 4.B | \$70.00 \$70.00 | \$700.00 \$700.00 | \$139.19 \$139.19 | \$1,391.90 \$1,391.90 | \$120.00 NA | \$1,200.00 NA | \$83.40 \$83.40 | \$834.00 \$834.00 | \$79.41 NA | \$397.05 NA | \$117.19 \$140.68 | \$1,171.90 \$1,406.80 | \$82.63 \$82.63 | \$826.30 \$826.30 | NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID | NO BID NO BID |
| Total 1A, 2A, 3A, 4A Total 1B, | | \$6,930.00 | | \$29,353.90 | | \$15,233.00 | | \$14,006.40 | | \$4,856.85 | | \$19,969.30 | | \$7,052.80 | | | |
| 2B, 3B, 4B | | \$7,410.00 | | \$19,764.90 | | \$0.00 | | \$14,006.40 | | \$4,972.00 | | \$22,655.50 | | \$7,894.80 | | | |

Recommend Award: Bodree Printing

* National Imprint Corporation quoted per thousand instead of 500.

** Office Depot offer based on Pensacola State College acceptance of Office Depot's terms and condition.

Angie C. Jones Director of Purchasing and Auxiliary Services